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THE WALNUT ROOM AT HOTEL NORTHLAND TO OPEN FEBRUARY 14th FOR  
VALENTINE’S DINNER  

 
GREEN BAY, WI, January 24, 2019 — The Walnut Room is ready to become Green Bay’s 
new favorite restaurant for dining, cocktails and for downtown “power breakfasts,” when 
it opens for dinner on February 14, 2019. The restaurant’s opening coincides with the 
official opening of Hotel Northland, Autograph Collection® which opens on February 14th 
to its first overnight guests.  
 
“The Walnut Room is original to the 1924 hotel and is truly a classic space in every 
sense,” said John Williams, General Manager, Hotel Northland. “It’s fine dining without 
being stuffy or pretentious, but always with impeccable service. Guests will find this to be 
a warm and welcoming environment, and it’s all anchored by a stunning, crescent-shaped 
bar.” 
 
The Walnut Room will be open for breakfast and dinner. The full dinner menu of culinary 
offerings includes prime steaks, fresh seafood, wild game, and house-made pastries.  
  
“Everything in our restaurant is made with locally sourced, seasonal ingredients,” said 
Chef J.R. Lundy, Executive Chef for the Hotel Northland. “Bread is made fresh onsite daily, 
and we specialize in creating both desserts and charcuterie right here in our kitchen.”  
 
Cocktails in The Walnut Room are handcrafted with fresh-squeezed juices and syrups 
made onsite, reminiscent of the 1920s, and local craft beers are on tap. The extensive 
wine list features over 200 selections.     
 
The Walnut Room seats 76 guests and in addition, offers a private dining room that 
accommodates up to 18 patrons for intimate events, special gatherings or milestone 
anniversaries. Breakfast is served seven days a week, from 6:30 a.m. until 11 a.m. Dinner 
will be offered Monday through Saturday, from 5 p.m. until 10 p.m.  
 



	

Reservations for The Walnut Room can be made online at www.thewalnutroomgb.com or 
at www.opentable.com, or by calling (920) 770-2399.  
 
For more information about The Walnut Room or the Hotel Northland visit 
www.thehotelnorthland.com.  
 
About Hotel Northland, Autograph Collection 
The Hotel Northland, Autograph Collection® is a luxury, 160-room boutique hotel in the 
heart of downtown Green Bay, Wisconsin, and a member of the exclusive Autograph 
Collection® Hotels. A historic hotel steeped in nostalgia, it originally opened in 1924 and 
operated through the 1960s, serving as residence for players of the Green Bay Packers and 
housing visiting NFL teams. Today the fully restored and richly appointed Hotel Northland 
stands as a return to grand hospitality, offering dining in the elegant Walnut Room and in 
Poke the Bear, a fan-inspired sports bar and restaurant. The hotel boasts modern 
amenities, gracious service, and upscale style that beautifully complement its restored 
mosaic tile floors, gleaming walnut paneling, and stunning chandeliers. For guest 
reservations and events, visit www.thehotelnorthland.com or call (920) 393-7499.  
 
About Greenwood Hospitality Group 
Greenwood Hospitality is based in Denver, with offices in Harrisburg, PA and Houston. 
Specializing in the acquisition, repositioning and management of upscale, full-service and 
select-service hotels throughout the United States, Greenwood is a preferred management 
partner for various brands, including Marriott, Hilton, IHG, Hyatt and Radisson. The 
company’s 20 property portfolio includes over 4,100 rooms and 2,700 ambassadors. 
Greenwood’s vision as articulated by its principals Tom Conran, Aik Hong Tan, and Bill 
Kohl, who together have 125 years of industry investment and management experience, is 
to set new excellence standards regarding property management, development services 
and the relationship it forges with its investors, property level ambassadors, and the 
communities in which they work. For more information, visit 
www.greenwoodhospitality.com.  
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